

Company:	Delta Western Inc	Alaska Petroleum Distributing Inc	Shoreside Petroleum Inc	Nenana Heating Services Inc	Crowley Petroleum Distribution Inc
LOCOMOTIVE FUEL - CARTAGE ONLY					
Location: Anchorage - "Keep Full" (Bulk Tank)					
Cartage fee per gallon:	\$.028	\$ NO BID	\$.0378	\$ NO BID	\$.0199
Location: Anchorage - "As Needed"					
Cartage fee per gallon:	\$.08	\$ NO BID	\$.147	\$ NO BID	\$.19
Minimum delivery quantity:	1,500	NO BID	1,500	NO BID	1,500
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Normal business hours:	0600 to 1800	NO BID	0800 to 1700	NO BID	M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
After normal business hours and holiday callout charge:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Contingency Direct Sell Rate:	\$ (.051)	\$ NO BID	\$ (.10)		
Contingency Direct Sell Index:	ANC		ANC		
Location: Birchwood - "As Needed"					
Cartage fee per gallon:	\$.105	\$ NO BID	\$.297	\$ NO BID	\$.19
Minimum delivery quantity:	1,500	NO BID	1,500	NO BID	1,500
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 130.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Normal business hours:	0600 to 1800	NO BID	0800 to 1700	NO BID	M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
After normal business hours and holiday callout charge:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 165.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Location: Portage - "As Needed"					
Cartage fee per gallon:	\$.16	\$ NO BID	\$.35	\$ NO BID	\$.29
Minimum delivery quantity:	1,500	NO BID	1,500	NO BID	1,500
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 145.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Normal business hours:	0600 to 1800	NO BID	0800 to 1700	NO BID	M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
After normal business hours and holiday callout charge:	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 155.00	\$ NO BID	\$ 250.00
Location: Fairbanks - "As Needed"					
Cartage fee per gallon:	\$ NO BID	\$.105	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Minimum delivery quantity:	NO BID	500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:	\$ NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Normal business hours:	NO BID	0800 to 1700	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
After normal business hours and holiday callout charge:	\$ NO BID	\$ 150.00	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Contingency Direct Sell Rate:	\$ NO BID	\$.135			
Contingency Direct Sell Index:		FAI			
FUEL SALES & DELIVERY - As Needed & Keep Full tanks					
Location: Seward					
Keep Full Tanks					
Type of Fuel:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:
Heating Oil #1; 2 x 1,000gal	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$.345	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
OPIS Index	NO BID	NO BID	ANC	NO BID	NO BID
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)					
Type of Fuel:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:	Per Gallon Markup:
ULSD #1/2:	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$.345	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):	NO BID	NO BID	ANC	NO BID	NO BID
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
Normal business hours:	NO BID	NO BID	0800 to 1700	NO BID	NO BID
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

Company:	Delta Western Inc	Alaska Petroleum Distributing Inc	Shoreside Petroleum Inc	Nenana Heating Services Inc	Crowley Petroleum Distribution Inc
Location: Portage Keep Full Tanks Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2; 1 x 3,000gal OPIS Index As Needed Fueling Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2: OPIS Index Minimum delivery quantity (if any): Less than minimum delivery quantity fee: Normal business hours: After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	Per Gallon Markup: \$.099 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.099 ANC 1,500 \$ 150.00 0600 to 1800 \$ 150.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.149 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.45 ANC 500 \$ 145.00 0800 to 1700 \$ 155.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.094 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.145 ANC 500 \$ 500.00 M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300 \$ 250.00
Location: Whittier Keep Full Tanks Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2; 1 x 1,000gal OPIS Index As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing) Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2: OPIS Index Minimum delivery quantity (if any): Less than minimum delivery quantity fee: Normal business hours: After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.60 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.60 ANC 500 \$ 95.00 0800 to 1700 \$ 135.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID
Location: Anchorage Keep Full Tanks Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2; 1 x 800gal & 1 x 2,000gal OPIS Index As Needed Fueling Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2: OPIS Index Minimum delivery quantity (if any): Less than minimum delivery quantity fee: Normal business hours: After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	Per Gallon Markup: \$ (.051) ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.05 ANC None \$ 0 None \$ 0	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.10 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$.20 ANC 500 \$ 145.00 0800 to 1700 \$ 155.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.05 ANC Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID
Location: Birchwood As Needed Fueling Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2: OPIS Index Minimum delivery quantity (if any): Less than minimum delivery quantity fee: Normal business hours: After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	Per Gallon Markup: \$.10 ANC 1,000 \$ 150.00 0600 to 1800 \$ 150.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.20 ANC 500 \$ 145.00 0800 to 1700 \$ 155.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.144 ANC 1,000 \$ 250.00 M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300 \$ 250.00
Location: Wasilla/Willow/Houston/Matanuska/Palmer Branch As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing) Type of Fuel: ULSD #1/2: OPIS Index Minimum delivery quantity (if any): Less than minimum delivery quantity fee: Normal business hours: After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:	Per Gallon Markup: \$.20 ANC 1,500 \$ 150.00 0600 to 1800 \$ 150.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.28 ANC 300 \$ 125.00 0800 to 1700 \$ 145.00	Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID Per Gallon Markup: \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID \$ NO BID NO BID NO BID	Per Gallon Markup: \$.135 ANC 500 \$ 250.00 M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300 \$ 250.00

Company:
Location: Talkeetna
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2; 1 x 1,000gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
Heating Oil #1:
OPIS Index
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Delta Western Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.099
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.169
ANC
2,000
\$ 150.00
0600 to 1800
\$ 150.00

Alaska Petroleum Distributing Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Shoreside Petroleum Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.85
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.85
ANC
500
\$ 350.00
0800 to 1700
\$ 195.00

Nenana Heating Services Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Crowley Petroleum Distribution Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.20
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.20
ANC
500
\$ 250.00
M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
\$ 250.00

Location: Hurricane/Hurricane Crossing
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2; 1 x 3,000gal, 1 x 5,000gal, 1 x 500gal
OPIS Index
Heating Oil #1; 1 x 1,000gal, 2 x 4,000gal
OPIS Index
Gasoline; 1 x 1,000gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
Heating Oil #1:
OPIS Index
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Per Gallon Markup:
\$.149
ANC
\$.199
ANC
\$.279
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.199
ANC
2,000
\$ 150.00
0600 to 1800
\$ 150.00

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$.25
ANC
\$.20
ANC
\$.25
ANC
1,000
\$ 250.00
M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
\$ 250.00

Location: Cantwell
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2; 1 x 1,000gal
OPIS Index
Heating Oil #1/ 1 x 5000gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Per Gallon Markup:
\$.516
ANC
\$.516
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.516
ANC
None
\$ 0
0800 to 1700
\$ 100.00

Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID

Company:
Location: Healy/South Denali
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2; 1 x 1,000gal & 1 x 500gal
OPIS Index
Heating Oil #1; 1 x 500gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Location: Nenana
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
Heating Oil #1; 1 x 500gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Location: Fairbanks
Keep Full Tanks
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2; 1 x 1,000gal
OPIS Index
Heating Oil #1; 1 x 1,000gal
OPIS Index
As Needed Fueling (may include locomotive wet-hosing)
Type of Fuel:
ULSD #1/2:
OPIS Index
Minimum delivery quantity (if any):
Less than minimum delivery quantity fee:
Normal business hours:
After normal business hours and holiday callout one-time charge:

Delta Western Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID

Alaska Petroleum Distributing Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.17
FAI
\$.17
FAI
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.135
FAI
500
\$ 125.00
0800 to 1700
\$ 150.00

Shoreside Petroleum Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID

Nenana Heating Services Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.516
ANC
\$.516
ANC
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.516
ANC
None
\$ 0
0800 to 1700
\$ 100.00
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.516
ANC
None
\$ 0
0800 to 1700
\$ 100.00
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID

Crowley Petroleum Distribution Inc
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$ NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
NO BID
\$ NO BID
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.35
FAI
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.25
FAI
950
\$ 250.00
M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
\$ 250.00
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.18
FAI
\$.25
FAI
Per Gallon Markup:
\$.18
FAI
950
\$ 150.00
M-F 0800 to 1700 Sat 0900 to 1300
\$ 150.00